No. 3 Written Laws (Miscelluneous Amendments)

1995

'THE UNITED REPUBLIC OF TANZANIA

NoO. 3 oF 1993

I ASSENT,

A. H. Mwinyi,
President

25T™ ApriL, 1995

An act to amend certain written laws

ENACTED by the Parliament of the United Republic of
Tanzania

1. This Act may be cited as the short
Written Laws (Miscellaneous Amendments) title

Act, 1995.

2. The written laws set ocut in the Amendment

First and Second columns of the 8chedule

of

to this Act are amended in the manner certain
specified opposite those laws in the written

third column of the schedule. Laws

113



FIRST COLUMN SEPOND COLUMN

Cap. 16 Thip Penal Code

=

Act No. 8 Thé Police Force

of 1990 ax?l Prisons Service

Cammission Act, 1990

THIRD COLUMN

The Penal Code, 1966, is hereby amended-

(a) in subsection (1) of section 114, by deleting
the words "five hundred shillings" and
substituting for them, the words "fifty
thousand shillings".

(b) in subsection (1) of section 175, by deleting
the words "two thousand shillings" and
substituting for them the words "two hundred
thousand shillings".

The Police Force and Prisons Service

Commission Act, 1990, is hereby amended.

-(a) by deleting subsections (2) to (5), and
substituting for them respectively the
following provisions:

"(2) The disciplinary authority in
respect of officers above the rank of
Assistant Commissioner is vested in the
Commission and the final disciplinary
authority is vested in the President.

(SIUIWpUIWY SROUD|IISTI) SMD'T UM € "ON

S661



PIRST COLUMN

ACT NO. 10 of

Iel

SECOND COLUMN THIRD COLUMN
The Pood (Control of The Act is amended in Section 37 by

t+ 1 - ~t i y [
quality) Act, 1978 deleting paragraph (b) of Subsection (2) and

substituting for it the following paragraph

"(b) destroy or dispose of that food
in any other way at the expense
of the owner of the food; and
where the owner fails to comply
with this provision, the
authorized officer may destroy or
dispose of the food and the
expense shall be recoverable as a
civil debt".

Passed in the National Assembly on the 21st February, 1995

G. F. MLAWA,
Clerk of the National Assembly

-

(Siawpuswry SNOPUDJ2ISIN) SHD] UDIIIM

X

y N

S661



