
Statutory Instrument 2000 No. 3375

file:///D/HTML/uk44209.htm[16.01.2025 11:44:09]

Statutory Instrument 2000 No. 3375
The Producer Responsibility Obligations (Packaging Waste)
(Amendment) (England and Wales) Regulations 2000

© Crown Copyright 2000

Statutory Instruments printed from this website are printed under the
superintendence and authority of the Controller of HMSO being the Queen's
Printer of Acts of Parliament.

The legislation contained on this web site is subject to Crown Copyright
protection. It may be reproduced free of charge provided that it is reproduced
accurately and that the source and copyright status of the material is made
evident to users.

It should be noted that the right to reproduce the text of Statutory Instruments
does not extend to the Queen's Printer imprints which should be removed from
any copies of the Statutory Instrument which are issued or made available to
the public. This includes reproduction of the Statutory Instrument on the
Internet and on intranet sites. The Royal Arms may be reproduced only where
they are an integral part of the original document.

The text of this Internet version of the Statutory Instrument which is published
by the Queen's Printer of Acts of Parliament has been prepared to reflect the
text as it was Made. A print version is also available and is published by The
Stationery Office Limited as the The Producer Responsibility Obligations
(Packaging Waste) (Amendment) (England and Wales) Regulations 2000,
ISBN 0 11 019009 2. The print version may be purchased by clicking here.
Braille copies of this Statutory Instrument can also be purchased at the same
price as the print edition by contacting TSO Customer Services on 0870 600
5522 or e-mail:customer.services@tso.co.uk.

Further information about the publication of legislation on this website can be
found by referring to the Frequently Asked Questions.

To ensure fast access over slow connections, large documents have been
segmented into "chunks". Where you see a "continue" button at the bottom of
the page of text, this indicates that there is another chunk of text available.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2000 No. 3375

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION, ENGLAND AND WALES

The Producer Responsibility Obligations (Packaging Waste) (Amendment)
(England and Wales) Regulations 2000

  Made 22nd December 2000  

  Coming into force 31st December 2000  

http://www.hmso.gov.uk/bookstore.htm?AF=A10075&FO=38383&ACTION=AddItem&ProductID=0110190092
mailto:customer.services@tso.co.uk
http://www.hmso.gov.uk/faqs.htm


Statutory Instrument 2000 No. 3375

file:///D/HTML/uk44209.htm[16.01.2025 11:44:09]

 

The Secretary of State, in exercise of his powers under sections 93 and 94(1)(c) and (p) of
the Environment Act 1995[1], for the implementation of article 6(1) of Directive
94/62/EC[2] and in exercise of all other powers enabling him in that behalf, after
consultation in accordance with section 93(2) of that Act, and after having regard to the
matters specified in section 93(6) as required by section 93(5) of that Act, hereby makes the
following Regulations:

Citation, commencement and extent
     1.  - (1) These Regulations may be cited as the Producer Responsibility Obligations
(Packaging Waste) (Amendment) (England and Wales) Regulations 2000, and shall come
into force on 31st December 2000.

    (2) These Regulations apply to England and Wales only.

Amendment of the Producer Responsibility Obligations (Packaging Waste)
Regulations 1997
     2.  - (1) The Producer Responsibility Obligations (Packaging Waste) Regulations
1997[3] are amended as follows.

    (2) In regulation 15 (forms and fees for registration of a scheme) - 

(a) in paragraph (2) for the words from "B is an amount" to "£126" substitute "B is
£460";

(b) in paragraph (3) for the words "B is the amount" to "the appropriate Agency"
substitute "B is £460".

    (3) In Schedule 2 (recovery and recycling obligations) - 

(a) in paragraph 4(c), for "52%", substitute "56%";

(b) in paragraph 5(c), for "16%", substitute "18%".

Signed by authority of the Secretary of State

Michael Meacher
Minister of State, Department of the Environment, Transport and the Regions

22nd December 2000

EXPLANATORY NOTE 

(This note is not part of the Regulations)

The Producer Responsibility Obligations (Packaging Waste) Regulations 1997 impose on
producers obligations to recover and recycle packaging waste, and related obligations, in
order to attain the targets in article 6(1) of Directive 94/62/EC.

 

http://www.hmso.gov.uk/si/si2000/20003375.htm#note1
http://www.hmso.gov.uk/si/si2000/20003375.htm#note2
http://www.hmso.gov.uk/si/si2000/20003375.htm#note3


Statutory Instrument 2000 No. 3375

file:///D/HTML/uk44209.htm[16.01.2025 11:44:09]

Other UK SIs | Home | National Assembly for Wales Statutory Instruments | Scottish Statutory
Instruments | Statutory Rules of Northern Ireland |  Her Majesty's Stationery Office

We welcome your comments on this site © Crown copyright 2000 Prepared 3 January 2001

These Regulations amend the fee which is to be charged by the Environment Agency on an
application for registration of a scheme under regulations 14 and 15 of those Regulations.
The fee is now calculated at the rate of £460 per member of the scheme, rather than on a
scale (from £760 to £126 per member) according to the number of members of the scheme.
They also increase the targets from 2001 onwards to 56% for recovery and 18% for
recycling.

Notes:

[1] 1995 c. 25; see section 93(8) for the definitions of "prescribed" and "regulations". The
functions of the Secretary of State were transferred - {d4}{n4}(i){t4}so far as exercisable
within devolved competence, to the Scottish Ministers by section 53 of the Scotland Act
1998 (c. 46) (but see section 57(1) of that Act);{d4}{n4}(ii){t4}so far as exercisable in
relation to Wales, to the National Assembly for Wales by the National Assembly for Wales
(Transfer of Functions) Order 1999 (S.I. 1999/672). See paragraph 5 of Schedule 3 to the
Government of Wales Act 1998 (c. 38) as to the continued exercise of the Secretary of
State's functions for the purpose of implementing any Community obligation of the United
Kingdom.back

[2] O.J. No. L365, 31.12.94, p. 10.back

[3] S.I. 1997/648; amended by S.I. 1999/1361, 3447.back

ISBN 0 11 019009 2

http://www.hmso.gov.uk/stat.htm
http://www.hmso.gov.uk/stat.htm
http://www.hmso.gov.uk/
http://www.wales-legislation.hmso.gov.uk/legislation/wales/w-stat.htm
http://www.wales-legislation.hmso.gov.uk/legislation/wales/w-stat.htm
http://www.scotland-legislation.hmso.gov.uk/legislation/scotland/s-stat.htm
http://www.scotland-legislation.hmso.gov.uk/legislation/scotland/s-stat.htm
http://www.scotland-legislation.hmso.gov.uk/legislation/scotland/s-stat.htm
http://www.northernireland-legislation.hmso.gov.uk/legislation/northernireland/ni-srni.htm
http://www.northernireland-legislation.hmso.gov.uk/legislation/northernireland/ni-srni.htm
http://www.hmso.gov.uk/
http://www.hmso.gov.uk/
http://www.hmso.gov.uk/hmsoform.htm
http://www.hmso.gov.uk/si/si2000/20003375.htm#n1
http://www.hmso.gov.uk/si/si2000/20003375.htm#n2
http://www.hmso.gov.uk/si/si2000/20003375.htm#n3

	Dysk lokalny
	Statutory Instrument 2000 No. 3375


