
'ffis fr€ + er<.fu sm g6t
ilrq glrdn(fr<r sr*Eo-e)+ isor

fu oqm rqifi fr.2-zz-Bds.rc
rwe / rs fu. e. M, ft-{i-s

3o-05-2oor""

dGftfiscis
'ffire/gd/ oe | 20 t3 - zot s ""

ffi {luilrEr
(srsrqrur)

urk*,R I r*,,rRd

mci6 rro l rugr, guan, fuio zs u{ zots- Qs 7, rrs 1e37

frfu sfrffir*q,dftt{rrr
riil-ffq, c-drff HEFI, irttt{rqgt

{qgt, frci{ zs{$zots

a;qissosz/d. roslzr-or/urs./o.rr./rs.-ofuEfurnqmorftrrfufuas{&fi-{f;&€qrfrqimzt-os -zotaal

{qqnrqtiftcis rl-os-zors*1iEqftffqgqfturqdgfft,cd-{dnrF&ileTnqffqn-*.r$+ftqr*rRnfuqumt.

eilqrrq * nqqm t am t aw enkrgvn,

e. t. fit€rd, orftknqfuc.

631



632 ostr€rrq {rdq{, fi{iqt 28 x{ 2ol s

udqrrq sr&Rqc
(scis 22 qzors)

qrcfrq qq (gd{qq {sir{l wfufrqq, 261a

qh {rrtfhd 6ri tg qfkf{qc.

rrna qur<rq *M s{fr ud€rEftEnc!-€a am Frqftfua sq I qt erfrFrqka €t : -

sftra 'rm, f{*<n l. (1) qe ef"Tfuqcqra$qfi (Bd1€rrdftifi) s{efiqq, 2014 i5-{cTlgrTl.

aql vRc.

(2) tcotts<nvqufede6{rqqt&n.

(3) ft t$arffu i rgd dm ffi & uq swn $atr* fr efoqfir em ffq-d61.

srtts,rE rrfl al z. e*sqB{rw+laqgesui mt&m eTfufoqq, :.q'27 (tszlq;t t6) Giq{tEs+q€q{d
ar(ge sq I t*q eT&fiqq * 6q i ft€et) Bl gvfr w* q€r6qifud tft n €sftRrd frqrqrn.
qfhFrfi ( 1e27 {I
g- 16) 6r ssrlEr.

qm zo qr dviq-n. :. qa or&ffqcff qrtr u o #sq-qnr (r)1, rre "q{ 6sREqa" * ernqr, rrq 'tscsnwi"
qfrtqrE-dfrqrdra.

qm :: or s'firrn. n. qowBftae#tTru::613q-trttt (l)i, rre "g+ csntq}" t trrnqt, rrq "qgaqnw}"
qfuErfudfrqrdra.

qm sr qr qriwr. s. qa erfuftwfi trnr stqlsq-uttt (2)l, {rq "qsEqRFqA" * tqn qt, rrq "<qe"m t.ra"
qfr{qfudfrqrqrA.

Em sz er ssrlr{. 6. (l) qa erfuftol ff eno szqisq-?rru (r)$r,f,Fqr, Fmhfua qRtrnfud frqr qrn,

eref(:-

"(l) we {6ft{qrq 6-rl6nqrt a d ft {id smkd+t dn€fqra q<qtqa sqq

$ ftiq i qt{ qr e${tl ft-qr mr t, d {i Bqq e1i tQ srwnr fit n }gff
sre etqn, {rq, qri, rd, rffi qrffi srq rq+1ffi qq orRr+r$ vr
gfrs srRr+Tt eRr omr;€d frq or q*'n. "

(2\ qi orfufruuff unr sz#sq-qtr (s)&qqarq Frqftfua *Sqrq, sTelf(:-

"' ( 6 ) srnrfddeprfu , 

"TFr{d 
srFrmfi + sTrasr# er4-dxrEmr&am gEdiiro

qr sq+ arr €}rw' A 6ff qr${ q"{i ff umrq& ff qcrfu ild, flfr t
d S T{m €1, trm sz-+ & er*t qarfrRa Erfuten i E-fr rFft.

(71 wi qrqi qr erRrsrkar iui ar"n aft{;a erftr*rft, efirr{ur qr 3rBssr t
ezirnfoat, qEi errdrsanrfo+r&{s qm$ elefuaFffi* *qmq
+ ft{n s{ft ffi+ ffi Erq eiRrorft ql qrrar uiaRa ot e*rn. "



ud{rr6 {Mqd, furiqi 28 q{ 2ol5 632 (1)

10.

ql or&ftw fi trm s2-6& sq-tm (2) irqr (6) fr, rre "srfu{rrr * enin" * ern qt, rc{r:
rrq "aftg< e{Rrd,rft+ eIraqr" qPRqrfudftqrqrn.

ql a-ftftw S tnl s : * run qr, Grqfufua qk{pnfud ftqr qri, ip&:-

"sl. qnr sz * ertft-{ qftT&d ffi sl f€R 6ri fr {rk"- tqr € QrF{q

,M or +i{ fi sTFr+rff, ffiqrffi s&ftfirri qm s: fr q$n +t€er]-ffi, ira,
vnural'{ ere +qoftrry$r * t, sv+f er ron erft:rg$a€vftq1) ?rrr sz }
Q{tiq vTk{d qFrdTt ur e@ *er+, 

"it 
ss srqatrsr frR* r{a 3mtr€qftqr

,rqrt, fuqnq+ilqleTRffirkdrrr*drd, qEQfl sTftdA, fu sritg\,titfr e{fu'*rfr

amqtnqrffi kdHriufu *qe*etr*#tSr+q#,EQrsqi,SsTfr ff fr (
frurure, xfrqfi +res+€Ifr Elirftqrfi 6ti qI, f{€{dsi{+iTl "

qa oR:ft w # urn o 3 1, 5q "+6 +nr+m t, ffi esfu si q{dd #t q*rfr 
, 
qr gqt+ t, qr

EH n srsfrq iirn" + {qrn qr, {r< "ir€.Fnlcrnr A, M ere& a e{r+ #d qffi qr gqf+

t, *q*sEffi sqnQqc6r 16&Tr, qrff t, qrs{q&n" qft€{rfra frqrqrn.

qi orftfr+u# unr rr*qsqFrqfufur er<:*nfuafrar<O, erufq:-

"oe -*. srqrrq 6r rqd u g*tor. -+tiakvlq€ s{Frfiqc qr Est s{tfti dqrq rrq

Frqql +ffi sq.ier6rsairqEfi Err{m4tnqre.nirq q€6rg&vrqt n, tilqt
qr+ilC,rnfr ssltQ gqd?rlqrF5qqlsrsGiEIiftqrt."

ql erF*free# um rr*ernqr, Frqfufua ufour&a frururi, eruiq:-

"cr. qqfl€ qtyrrfirdffvk.- trl {rer{f.dR, rrqq* i Bftr{fir em,

fttft qq srFr+rt dt esr€ qr e*rft fo qe-

(6 ) CnStSqk t, ffi ffaa+ti gkg{i {ik fuqcrn tfr sq} eTnr oz qr

trrtr o:t fffrf{effi sTqrr.r i nri dr{ qi erwnrftqr t, es B{s{reT *
ft e, ffi Eft n {€ €id t fr sq+ Qsr wrff.r fr qr t, uFilfi + sq i *l{
trqiTQr nidr& Et; sfir

(q) ws siti {iqk srfd{r'r frq sr+ * <rkarnc ti * fit'rr s$ilI&d Ei d
.r4t, acnTPdfd srRmrteRrsrfu{vr 4r sTQqr qrfta frs qr+ + W W
eTRrfirff eRr qur urfifud ss+ {q sr ricrq 6r fti qri ct, ffi S qcq

Enfr€n6f.

ti qRr+rfr+1, qqrhlrft, Qd trcrrftrqrt0{aqr ffiot {<rq ftq qri qr, rifu'q
qfu qit, qRqEe{fuqrit, e+iikaerfrarurqm, sft qfirlda$rrri€qk, qfr q}i
d,ftS<q<{ori.ffautQqkqQ$qqfta+ ftcc oTrn fii sff Td A
fl"ft.

ot{cff fi sTerdrt,rfl unr*sr*{Tddsqsrffi r$€tnv-qr+fr +ttw#ffi I
erftq Mqr q< eTnr+r$ q-S t, eft sq-Err ll ) + €rs (*)+ srtfi-{ skfl + Fq I
yft Ff&a ?rn & nRr ffi rff qrri i et sqq ft qa * dt gi Q oe rS &ft :

qm 52-i5 6I
s{rl s--r.

mo s: qr dqlq-q.

qrtl or mr {Yiqn.

qm rt tr g'ql]Erq.

qI{r 66-i6 6T
qft:+qTg"T.

11.

(2)

(3)



632 (2) Ed€rqrrsq{, G:{is 28 n{ 2o1s

qrEi$e-{ sqq * qrr& t ffi {dq fr+$ srqird ftqr ,rql t, ft.fr
wtqn * riqft rd t qr Q* w eqe S qrc& fr fua+r qa w wn rqi i qc i" d
{fuqqkft}Edfodftqrvre+rn Qrk arfi+f&aff nr{{qfu , (qrsqqQnt-q) qe

atf t, <eEont+A6nRrh€<rqqrqren$d({+kSqaat,*ttsqd, ft€ft
#qreirft. qfirf&t +t sq-q *q-d art Fidrn ffqr s*'ft qE qe qrnREh, s.6n#
{qfu r$t qr sq+ {e or ti<rq oi ftqrqnr t. "

ql vFrfrra$ tnn zr*ernqr, Frqfrfua ufourfurfraruri, erufq:-

"'tr. 1e wfufuar * erti-i ft-{d Ecii 61 qftqftia o.d fr nftF. - trq rr.dn,
wu-*i ef+qrtrem, ft{sr?q}ilftfrqgirfuqn qfuftqq, tszt (I8716r{i. I)ff
qm r z t e1""fl-{fiTdgcfi* qEdi, gs srfufrq€# mrr zo * stfl-{ qft{q fts 'rs
r+*vg +fre eqr Ecfqr qldd ftqr qrq'rn +fl fr ft sfud v"i, fr-g qt
Fmfu fu a A erfti-* Td t n, qqfc., -

trm zr ar qulEq.

qm zz +r q'riEc.

v-&*osft*ftc

q-+d6 lte + fts

u-&6:fu+iAs

r&* :ftiv, m), gw, :1t, i-d,
t-e,ffi,qfifiqrs{+ffi
qrqqqgAftc.

(r€E$Rtqq,

a$qqr{Eqs,

q*dtqs,

qqrs sqq

rnguft -+rar*umr+hft qfu qEAqg&{qrqrs+re-d+qc,rsdr&-{r0

am gnf+ + 3rRft-€ qar firdlfta * d!-qftrd <it w at3ff qlq +ff . "

13. ql erfuftoe* um zzi,sr6( "gswRsqA"*emtn,qrE "rsaentqn" ufotnfudfrqr
srn

rng, frri6 2s q{ 261t

scis soe7ld. 16512l -q/nrs. /B.rr./ rs.- urra & {fttrn * wg*< :as } uue (3) + eqstvr i Ea E$Fr *
Hcdqs Erfuq-diTtnid u e-os-zors sr sim erger< trewm * urftr*n t r.a-<enr nq;tRra ftq qrm t.

v$urrq * rrwqra t ru i am odnrgvn,
q. *. lHq-d, srftft-€ {fuq



udarr6{Mqd. fr{isi 28 q{ 2ols 632 (3)

CHHATTISGARH ACT
(No.22 of20l5)

THE INDIAN FOREST (CHI{ATTISGARH AMENDMEN'I) ACT, 2014

An Act further to amend the Indian Forest Act, 1927 (No. l6 of 1927) in its application

to the State ofChhattisgarh.

Be it enacted by the Chlattisgarh Legislature in the Sixty-fifth Year ofthe Republic
oflndia" as follows :-

I. (t)

Q)

(,

This Act may be called the Indian Forest (Chhattisgarh Amendment) Act, short title, extent

2014, and commencement.

lt shall extend to the whole State ofChhallisgarh.

lt shall come into force on such date as the State Govemment may by
notification, in the Official Gazette, appoint.

2. The Indian ForestAct,192'7 (16 of 1927) (hereinafter referred to as the PrincipalAct), in
its application to the State of Chhattisgarh, be amended in the manner hereinafter
provided.

Amendmeni of
Certral Act, 192'7
(No. 16 of 1927) in its
application to the
sttte of
Chhattisga rh.

ln sub-section ( l) of Section 26 of the Principal Act, for the words "one thousand Amendment

rupees" the words "ten thousand rupees" shall be substituted. section 26'

ln sub-section (l) of Section 33 of the Principal Act, for the words "one thousand Amerdment

rupees" the words "ten thousand rupees" shall be substituted. section 33'

In sub-section (2) of Section 5l of the Principal Act, for the words "one thousand Amendmcnt

rupees" the words "ten thousand rupees" shall be substituted. section 5l'

6. (l) For sub-section (1) ofsection 52 ofthe PrincipalAct, the following shall be Amendmcnt of
substituted, namely.- section 52.

When there is reason to belive that a forest offence has been

committed in respect of any reserved forest and protected forest or
forest produce, the produee and all tools, boats, vehicles, ropes,
chains or any other article used in committing such offence may be
seized by any forest officer or police officer."

After sub-section (5) ofSection 52 ofthe PrincipalAct, the following
shall be added, namely.-

"(6) The seized property shall continue to be under custody
until confirmation ofthe order ofthe authorized officer by
the AppellateAuthority or until the expiry ofthe period for
initiating 'suo moto'action by him whichever is earlier, as

prescribed under Section 52-A.

Where the authorized officer having j urisdiction over the
case is himself involved in seizure or investigation, the
next higher authority may transfer the case to any other
officer ofthe same rank for conducting proceedings under
this Section."

"(l )

(2)

(7)



632 \4\ Bd€rE {rq'rr, frcis zsq{ zors

Amendment
Section 52-A.

Amendment
Section 53.

Amendmcnt
Section 63.

ot '7.

of 8.

of 9.

In sub-section (2) and (6) ofSection 52-Aofthe Principal Act, for the words "order
confiscation" the words "order of the authorized officer" shall be substituted,
respectively.

For Section 5i ofthe Principal Act, the lollowing shall be substituted, namely"-

"53. Powerto release property seized underSection 52.-Any Forest oficer ofa
rank not inferior to that ofa Ranger, who, or whose sub-ordinate, has seized

anytools, boats, vehicles or any other article under Section 52, may release

th€ same, on the execution bythe ownerthereof, ofa security, in a form as may

be prescribed, ofan amount equal to the value ofsuch propefiy, as estimated

by such offrcer, for the production ofthe property so released, ifand when so

required, before the authorized officer under Section 52 or the Magistrate
having jurisdiction to try the offence on account of which the seizure has

been made."

ln Section 63 of the Principal .Act, for the words "shall be punishable with
imprisonment foraterm which may extend to two years, or with fine, or with both", the

words "shall be punishable with imprisonment for a term which may extend to two
years, or with fine which shall not be less than twenty five thousand rupees, or with
both" shall be substituted.

After Section 66 ofthe PrincipalAct, the following shall be insefted.-

"66-.4. Attempt or abetment of an offence.- Any person who attempts to contravene

or abets the contravention ofany provision ofthis Act or the rules made there

under shall be deemed to have contravened such provisons or rules."

For Section 68 ofthe Principal Act, the following shall be substituted, namely.-

"68. Power to compound offences.- (l ) The State Government may, be

notification in the Oflicial Gazette, empower a Forest-Offcer.-

(a) to accept ftom any person against whom a reasonable suspicion

exists that he has comfritted any forest offence, other than an

offence specified in Section 62 or Section 63, a sum ofmoney by way
of compensation for the offence which such person is suspected to
have committed, and

when any property has been seized as liable to confiscation, to
release the same at any time before an order ofconfiscation is passed

by the authorised officer on payment of the value thereof as

estimated by such officer.

On the payment ofsuch sum ofmoney, or such value, or both, as the case may

be, to such officer, the suspected person, if in custody, shall be discharged,

the property, ifany, seized shall be released, and no further proceeding shall

be taken against such person or propefty.

A Forest-of'ficer shall not be empowered under this section unless he is a

Forest-officer ofa rank not inferior to that ofa Ranger, and the sum ofmoney
accepted as compensation under clause (a) ofsub-section (1) shall in no case

be less than two times the value ofthe forest produce :

Provided that in case the forest produce in respect of which an

offence has been committed is not the property ofthe Covemment or in case

the value of the forest produce is less than one thousand rupees, the

suspected person may be discharged and the propeny (other than the forest

Insertion
Section 66-A.

Amcndment
Section 68.

10.

.

(b)

e)

(3)



rdq.rd{rd[d, fui-+ zs Ir{ zo r s

produce), if any, seized may be released on payment of the sum often
thousand rupees or the value ofthe seized property, whichever is less. The
seized forest produce may be released only if it is not the property of the
Govemment or on the pa).rnent ofthe value thereof, as the case may be."

12. For Section 71 of the Principal Act, the following shall be substituted, namely :- lffljfl;i:
,t71. Power to alter fixed under that Act.- The State Govemment may, by

notification in the Offlcial Gazette, dtect that, in Iieu ofthe fines fixed under
Section l2 ofthe Cattle-trespass Act, l87l ( I of l87l ), there shall be levied for
each head ofcattle impounded under Section 70 ofthisAct, such fines as it
thinls fit, but not exceeding the following, that is to say.-

632 (s''

For each elephart

For each camel

For each buffalo

For each neat cattle,
ass, pig, ram, ewe,
sheep, lamb, goat,

kid or any other cattle.

One thousand rupees

Two huadred and fiity rupees

One hundred rupees

Fifty rupees

13_

Provided that the cost of maintenance of such cattle during the
period ofimpoundment shall be recoverable at the prevailingrates as fixed by
the Divisional Forest OfIicer, in addition to the fine."

In Section 77 ofthe Principal Act, for the words "one thousand rupees", the words "ten Amendment

thousand rupees" shall be substituted. section 77.
of

{qrc*, gaur drr Aq{ srrFf, irrlers ERr rrr#q {ivnaq, wgttgfta awr*rRn - zor s.


