U I FHHIS

“foene W & =TI T o
“Sefierre/F1/09/2013-2015.”

e P (o e e ) % dwwr
R IR, FHHIH Wi1.2-22-BAPRQ
e [ 38 R | foaE, REie

30-05-2001.”

FHTF 316 ] TR, TEAR, &7 28 78 2015— S8 7, 9 1937

fafty ofie faumrht wrf fawm

TG, T 28 7E 2015

T 5097 /3. 165/21-3/UTE. [B.71. [ 15. — Sl 01 fatie AHT 1 ewferaa erfrivas fora w famis 21-08 20141
TSIl T T3 14-05-2015 i gfr i STFART T 21 Y 2, TAGERT AR il S o fore wertere fofm s 2.

TG o TSTUTA o 0 § AT ATSAIHR,
u. %. Rigq, srfafem .

631



632

Fecl e TS0, TS 28 W2 2015

g ww, faenx
qYgT WA,

gETE s w1

@I gE w9 H Hiy
afafran (1927 =1
H. 16) ®T "Wy T,

I 26 HT HIN G,

I 33 H1 G,

I 51 &1 SIMGA.

YT 52 HT GTHA,

BRI ST

(FHHIF 22 99 2015)
AR a9 (ST quiYA) ifrfrad, 2014

Bl Tsa #1 av] g0 U § udE 99 afufwm, 1927 (1927 F1 4. 16)
ot weifam F 2q aftfam,

YTRA U & Ted 9 # Sallaie AUmaved g1 MEfiad =0 | a8 At g -

I (1) g A AR 9 (SR Hoes) Afaf=am, 2014 Fearw.
(2) FEHT T ST ST T WX 2.
(3) g Ul A & T 2R o o v e s | arftrgeen s fee

2. T [T TS o ] B0 w0 A WRe T a erffeem, 1927 (1927 1 16) (S 9 38 UwEd U
arferfvmn & wa # fafde ) w1 30w 3o v 3uste Of o st s,

3 T srferfrrm i T 26 1 39-UT (1) H, 7= “UF gAR TR F W W, T2 “FH AN e’
Tfereenfua fran SH.

4, et Atiferam i g 33FIIA-UT (1) H, T2 “TF 2R o0 & WA W, T2 TH R I
ufereenfua fra s,

5. el AT ] SR 5171 IU-URT (2) H, 953 “UF TR v R W, UE T g e
Tz T S,

6. (1) Tt rfrferes w1 R 52 1 IU-4m (1) % s o, eefafes aioeentua e S,

TeIT ;-

“(1) o e e s o o 8 ok e smféaa o o Sfam s A en 9o
o el H 1 9 orumrel e s 2, A 93U o T STy e | U
T AT, A, A, W, St A R o g e aa it @
gferst arfererrl 2T erfinpEa foren s e,

(2) et eferforzrm = e 52 0 3u-m (5) % v, efafa SEia, el -

“(6)  wfirpdie wwmfe, Tferel Stferermdl o erew 1 erdiel TRt 310 g B o
I 3EF B U § AT TRH F F1 HTaAaiel | Gamd o, 376 9
i1 ofi gefer 21, o 52- % refiw aenfaten erfiren & a @l

(7) el WIF TR AR e Sell Wiferpe Attrrr), Ao @ g 3
T T 2, TR STl Iw TR 29 U1 % AAsie SrEareal F HeeE
% ford 3t Soft 3 Freft s arftrerr) =01 wrwen siafed e ek, ”



et enTg Tt e 28 18 2015

632 (1)

10.

11,

e St it SR 523 Y IU-EIRI (2) e (6) H, TR AR & AW F T W, FAL:
=2 “Tfirpd fasER & enaw wioeentue fo S,

e siferfem i R 53 % v u, fterias nieeentud i @, v -

(13

53

arl 52 &% witha afinrda dufa #i s &0 Fata- T |8 e
SIUTT =T i o TR, T o Toreeh erefieer <t 9y 52 % il #is fieiw, 971,
I AT HIE o1 o ANFEE it 8, IR (39 THR ARSI Fafed 1) 97T 52F
artfie Tt Stfer o wfotede % wHE, ST S ST o e WeE aTiereuT iR
T 2, ferermeon e <R erferenTie T 2, S U TuteTd B, U e o Ue U etferer
BT AT VTR ford Ut S et o Hool % STar i Ul e 31, U 7ea |, S T fafed
Tope T, wifergfer a6t 3ok v g fraER a W, e R

A iferfEE e 63 H, W T FET |, oreh ot 1 9w whl 6 e, AT A, A
FF1 9 20 B 6 T W, W AR FRET o, Tt st S ad o $ 2w a g
W, Tl U=l 19 BTR S0 FH 1 1 2071, A1 o, SUSHE g Wi RS,

e srferferem i 9T 66 % T frmforiaa o zenfue e S, et -

*66-. STUH F TGS A1 FURVL. - FE Al o1l 30 ARH a1 36% e\ a9 1

Tl = forelt Sua e 61 Sectert e =i e 0T a1 Socte . e o1 ORUT T, 1 I8
T SO T 36 U 3ual o1 9ol =1 Seoos frane.”

et aAferf=m il a1 68 % e W, Ffofian wirenfia s, s -

(11

68.

(2)

(3)

AU T WA FA K WA~ (1) T TR, TS0 H AgE 5,
forelt o= arfienrdt o6t TR =he wekell o 13-

(®) T =t s foeg 1 gy g9 e 2 iR e e 62
o 63 | fafwies el erowms | i 12 a9 smouy e 2, 39 oauy &
foru, fsraes o o g weg & T 2ae W ot &, uiee % = d #12
ETRITS WicTE e e, i

(@) T HIE Fule iRl U S o T 2 % FR AfnEe #R
T 2, T TR ST ST SATSIER0T 1 eIy Ui e W % ud o
TR ST T TR forel Sk Jedl ol e & o3 S o, Tt it e

S fmEwR

U ST 1, TR, Tl et o1 O e 1 S 6 el R 9 W, wiea
ek o, T T8 ATRETH &, I ot FaT SITem, iR STiinpeia i s wufe, afd i
1, Toreer e ot ST e U e o Ut Wt o e ormt i Fargl wE A
Eui

1S ¥ O ATERRRY, TH YR 2 STHH o o WY S8l g s o {3 =g T Siofi |
ST Ut 61 a1 ATIRREL 981 B, 3R 3u-4N (1) 3 =0 (%) & onfi= uias s s |
uferTEia e ) Tfy et ot wnret 3§ 99 3U % §e o 21 9 w0 T8 En

Rl 52-% @1
GRut:CH

oI 53 ®T GG,

HTT 63 HT GG

g 66-h Ll
AT,

HTRT 68 F1 HINGA.



632 (2) e enTe T, B 28 72 2015

TR Ul A 30 F WG | fores Sag d wE ey R e g e S
TR | wifed 78 & A1 Ueft 5 U 3 el § T e Ok R e @ wE E Al
feeer safer 1 Sifem oo e ok s £ 7 Huf, (@9 a9 fir) af2
5 B, 79 EoT S0 1 i o war ot o AfiepEie Hafed & ged W, S Wi e al, g
Frenwt. sl a9 3us e auft fafam fron v ats g gty swr S
wafed 1 & o1 o W o war e 2.

w71 w1 gWEA 12 e eferteam £t e 71 % wm W, Feafafan et fem o, s -

“71. 7@ afufEm & aEfim fea guia w1 aiafda w@ # g, - 75 W,
s 1 rfbrgen g, fem 3 wai i oy erfoerr arfirfemm, 1871 (187114, 1) F1
1R 12 % A Tt Sl o waa 8, 39 arfafam i am 70 % @t aieas e
ek ug % forn U At SgdE fen Som S fE T Sfaa e, R e

Termferfam @ erfers 7t gm, s -

e et & forw UF IR HUL,
TeE e ¥ forw =1 1 =T 30T,
TedeR i o form U H Y,

T e, T, G, He, W, U= HUY

Tz, T, S a1 39E A

1 2= g o fer,

] UG 3l AT =6 ST U8 Y] o T 1 el aqAuSaneehi
SRISHM o arfiad e fruffa 6t o8 veafer o3 w ol ma grt.”

arl 77 %1 guieE, 13, e frfoem i o 77 8, v T FER eU % R W, U T R eud . Wiereeiud R
B

T, fai 28 7 2015

AT 5097/, 165/21-31 /9. [B.31./15.— URA F WGUH F AGw53 348 F @ (3) T w0 # 79 fawm i
THGETF AR G 28-05-2015 T SIS SAETE T F UTUFR & UASZINT TeHTH9I foha ST 2.

BTG & TSI o T8 § T4 SRR,
u. %. ffaq, erifafam atm.



e eTe U0, 3R 28 WS 2015

632 (3)

CHHATTISGARH ACT
(No.22 0f2015)

THE INDIAN FOREST (CHHATTISGARH AMENDMENT) ACT, 2014

An Act further to amend the Indian Forest Act, 1927 (No. 16 0f 1927) in its application

to the State of Chhattisgarh.

Be it enacted by the Chhattisgarh Legislature in the Sixty-fifth Year of the Republic

of India, as follows :-

1.

L

(1) This Act may be called the Indian Forest (Chhattisgarh Amendment) Act,

2014,
(2) It shall extend to the whole State of Chhattisgarh.
3 It shall come into force on such date as the State Government may by

notification, in the Official Gazette, appoint.

The Indian Forest Act, 1927 (16 of 1927) (hereinafter referred to as the Principal Act), in
its application to the State of Chhattisgarh, be amended in the manner hereinafter
provided.

In sub-section (1) of Section 26 of the Principal Act, for the words “one thousand
rupees” the words “ten thousand rupees™ shall be substituted.

In sub-section (1) of Section 33 of the Principal Act, for the words “one thousand
rupees” the words “ten thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

In sub-section (2) of Section 51 of the Principal Act, for the words “one thousand
rupees” the words “ten thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

(1) For sub-section (1) of Section 52 of the Principal Act, the following shall be
substituted, namely .-

“1) When there is reason to belive that a forest offence has been
committed in respect of any reserved forest and protected forest or
forest produce. the produce and all tools, boats, vehicles, ropes,
chains or any other article used in committing such offence may be
seized by any forest officer or police officer.”

) After sub-section (5) of Section 52 of the Principal Act, the following
shall be added, namely.-

“(6) The seized property shall continue to be under custody
until confirmation of the order of the authorized officer by
the Appellate Authority or until the expiry of the period for
initiating ‘suo moto’ action by him whichever is earlier, as
prescribed under Section 52-A.

(7 Where the authorized officer having jurisdiction over the
case is himself involved in seizure or investigation, the
next higher authority may transfer the case to any other
officer of the same rank for conducting proceedings under
this Section.”

Short title, extent
and commencement.

Amendment of
Central Act, 1927
(No. 16 of 1927) in its
application tc the
State of
Chhattisgarh.

Amendment of
Section 26.
Amendment of
Section 33.
Amendment of
Section 51.
Amendment of
Section 52.



Sel TR e, e 28 08 2015

632 (4)
Amendment of 7. In sub-section (2) and (6) of Section 52-A of the Principal Act, for the words “order
Section 52-A. confiscation” the words “order of the authorized officer” shall be substituied,
respectively.
gmeﬂdm*‘;’; of 8 For Section 33 of the Principal Act, the following shall be substituted, namely.-
ection 53.

*53. Power to release property seized under Section 52.- Any Forest officer of a
rank not inferior to that of a Ranger, who, or whose sub-ordinate, has seized
any tools, boats, vehicles or any other article under Section 52, may release
the same, on the execution by the owner thereof, of a security, in a form as may
be prescribed, of an amount equal to the value of such property, as estimated
by such officer, for the production of the property so released, if and when so
required, before the authorized officer under Section 52 or the Magistrate
having jurisdiction to try the offence on account of which the seizure has
been made.”

Amendment of 9 In Section 63 of the Principal Act, for the words “shall be punishable with

Heetion 63 imprisonment for a term which may extend to two years, or with fine, or with both™, the
words ‘““shall be punishable with imprisonment for a term which may extend to two
vears, or with fine which shall not be less than twenty five thousand rupees, or with
both” shall be substituted.

Insertion of 10. After Section 66 of the Principal Act, the following shall be inserted.-

Section 66-A.

“66-A. Attempt or abetment of an offence.- Any person who attempts to contravene
or abets the contravention of any provision of this Act or the rules made there
under shall be deemed to have contravened such provisons or rules.”

Amendment of 11. For Section 68 of the Principal Act, the following shall be substituted, namely.-
Section 68.

“68. Power to compound offences.- (1) The State Government may, be
notification in the Official Gazette, empower a Forest-Officer.-

(a) to accept from any person against whom a reasonable suspicion
exists that he has committed any forest offence, other than an
offence specified in Section 62 or Section 63, a sum of money by way
of compensation for the offence which such person is suspected to
have committed, and

(b) when any property has been seized as liable to confiscation, to
release the same at any time before an order of confiscation is passed
by the authorised officer on payment of the value thereof as
estimated by such officer.

2) On the payment of such sum of money, or such value, or both, as the case may
be, to such officer, the suspected person, if in custody, shall be discharged,
the property, if any, seized shall be released, and no further proceeding shall
be taken against such person or property.

3) A Forest-officer shall not be empowered under this section unless he is a
Forest-officer of a rank not inferior to that of a Ranger, and the sum of money
accepted as compensation under clause (a) of sub-section (1) shall in no case
be less than two times the value of the forest produce :

Provided that in case the forest produce in respect of which an
offence has been committed is not the property of the Government or in case
the value of the forest produce is less than one thousand rupees, the
suspected person may be discharged and the property (other than the forest



Beterg T, o 28 WE 2015 632 (5)
produce), if any, seized may be released on payment of the sum often
thousand rupees or the value of the seized property, whichever is less. The
seized forest produce may be released only if it is not the property of the
Government or on the payment of the value thereof, as the case may be.”
12. For Section 71 of the Principal Act, the following shall be substituted, namely :- Ame“dm;';t of
Section 71.
ST L Power to alter fixed under that Act.- The State Government may, by
notification in the Official Gazette, direct that, in lieu of the fines fixed under
Section 12 of the Cattle-trespass Act, 1871 (1 of 1871), there shall be levied for
each head of cattle impounded under Section 70 of this Act, such fines as it
thinks fit, but not exceeding the following, that is to say.-
For each elephant One thousand rupees
For each camel Two hundred and fifty rupees
For each buffalo One hundred rupees
For each neat cattle, Fifty rupees
ass, pig, ram, ewe,
sheep, lamb, goat,
kid or any other cattle.
Provided that the cost of maintenance of such cattle during the
period of impoundment shall be recoverable at the prevailing rates as fixed by
the Divisional Forest Officer, in addition to the fine.”
13. In Section 77 ofthe Principal Act, for the words “one thousand rupees”, the words “ten ~ Amendment of

thousand rupees™ shall be substituted. Section 77.

e, HEU1 A S HIE, TR S 9T A AR, TR i qun waie - 2015,



