Water Resources (Charges) (Amendment) (Jersey) Order 2011 Article 1

=

Jersey

WATER RESOURCES (CHARGES) (AMENDMENT)

Made

(JERSEY) ORDER 2011

8th September 2011

Coming into force 15th September 2011

THE MINISTER FOR PLANNING AND ENVIRONMENT, in pursuance
of Articles 25(1)(b) and 49 of the Water Resources (Jersey) Law 2007*, orders
as follows —

1 Water Resources (Charges) (Jersey) Order 2009 amended
In Article 1(1) of the Water Resources (Charges) (Jersey) Order 20097 —

(@)

(b)

(©

(d)

in sub-paragraph (a) for the amount “£40” there shall be substituted the
amount “£41”;

in sub-paragraph (b) for the amount “£80” there shall be substituted the
amount “£82”";

in sub-paragraph (c) for the amount “£120” there shall be substituted the
amount “£123”;

in sub-paragraph (d) for the amount “£99,040” there shall be substituted
the amount “£101,516”.

2 Citation and commencement

This Order may be cited as the Water Resources (Charges) (Amendment)
(Jersey) Order 2011 and shall come into force 7 days after it is made.

DEPUTY R.C. DUHAMEL OF ST. SAVIOUR

Minister for Planning and Environment

Price code: A Page - 1
R&0.115/2011



Endnotes Water Resources (Charges) (Amendment) (Jersey) Order 2011

! chapter 27.960
2 chapter 27.960.20
Page - 2

R&0.115/2011



