B 2167

Suppliment tal-Gazzetta tal-Gvern ta’ Malta Nru. 18,747, 6 ta’ Mejju, 2011

Tagsima B

A.L. 168 tal-2011

ATT DWAR L-INBID
(KAP. 436)

Regolamenti ta’1-2011 li jemendaw ir-Regolamenti dwar
Protokolli ta’ Produzzjoni ta’ I-Inbid D.O.K.

BIS-SAHHA tas-setghat moghtija bl-artikoli 12(1) u 27 ta’
1-Att dwar 1-Inbid, u skond ir-regolamenti 10 u 11 tar-Regolamenti
tal-2006 dwar id-Denominazzjoni ta’ 1-Origini u ta’ Indikazzjonijiet
Geografi¢i, il-Ministru ghar-Rizorsi u 1-Affarijiet Rurali, fuq il-
parir tal-Bord biex Jirregola I-Inbid, ghamel dawn ir-regolamenti 1i
gejjin:-

1. [It-titolu ta’ dawn ir-regolamenti hu Regolamenti ta’
1-2011 i jemendaw ir-Regolamenti dwar Protokolli ta’ Produzzjoni
ta’ 1-Inbid D.O K., u ghandhom jinqraw u jiftiechmu haga wahda
mar-Regolamenti ta’ 1-2007 dwar Protokolli ta’ Produzzjoni ta’
lI-Inbid D.O K., hawn izjed ’il quddiem imsejha “ir-regolamenti
principali”.

2. Skeda I li tinsab mar-regolamenti principali ghandha tigi
emendata kif gej:

(a) minflok il-kliem “4.1 Varieties allowed for the use
of White/Red/Rose DO mention:” u t-tabella fis-subartikolu
4.1 taghha, ghandu jidhol dan li gej:

“4.1 The DO “MALTA” Q.W.P.S R. wines shall be
produced from grapes harvested in the region described
in article 2 and only from the following grape varieties:

Titolu.

A.L.416ta’1-2007.

Jemenda 1- iSkeda
1 1i tinsab mar-
regolamenti princ¢ipali.



B 2168

Typology Variety code Grape Variety *
11 Chardonnay
17 Girgentina
12 Chenin Blanc
24 Insolia
White 42 Pinot Bianco
43 Sauvignon Blanc
54 Trebbiano
55 Vermentino
56 Viognier
33 Moscato Bianco
34 Moscato di Alessandria
36 Moscato Giallo
Red / Rosé 7 Cabernet Sauvignon
6 Cabernet Franc
16 Gellewza
31 Merlot
49 Syrah
8 Carignan
9 Carmenere
22 Grenache
18 Graciano
25 Lambrusco
32 Montepulciano **
40 Nero d’Avola **
39 Negroamaro
37 Mourvedre




41 Petit Verdot
44 Pinot Noir
45 Primitivo
47 Sangiovese
51 Tempranillo

(b) fis-subartikolu 4.1.1 taghha, minflok il-kliem “the
names of 2 or 3 grape varieties” ghandhom jidhlu I-kliem
“the names of the 2 or 3 grape varieties being such varieties
having the highest percentage representation” ;

(¢) fis-subartikolu 4.2 taghha:

(1) minflok il-kliem “4.2 Varieties allowed for the
use of a Mono Varietal DO mention” ghandu jidhol dan
li gej:

“4.2 The DO “MALTA” Q.W.P.S.R. wines
shall be produced from grapes harvested in the
region described in article 2 and only from the
following grape varieties:” ; u

(ii) fit-tabella, minnufih wara r-ringiela “Primitivo”
ghandha tidhol din ir-ringiela gdida li gejja:

Sangiovese 47 Sangiovese

(d) fis-subartikolu 5.2 taghha, minnufih wara I-kliem
“shall be of the Vertical Shoot Positioning (VSP) type”
ghandhom jidhlu 1-kliem “or the traditional bush method
(alberello)” ;

(e) minflok it-tabella li tinsab fl-artikolu 6 taghha,
ghandu jidhol dan 1i gej:

B 2169



B 2170

For Mono
Varietal
wines:
Maximum
Minimum
Typology Variety Yield in
Natural
hL/Ha
Alcoholic
Strength
(% vol.)
Chardonnay
Sauvignon Blanc
84 11.0%
Viognier
Insolia
White or
Pinot Bianco
Mono
Trebbiano
Varietal of
Chenin Blanc
this
tvool Vermentino o1 10,59
ypology 5%
Moscato Bianco
Moscato di
Alessandria
Moscato Giallo
Girgentina 91 10.0%
Rosé or Gellewza 91 10.0%
Mono
Varietal of
: Grenache
this 91 10.5%
typology Syrah




Red or
Mono
Grenache
Varietal of ) 24 11.0%
Gellewza
this
typology
Cabernet
Sauvignon
Cabernet Franc
Carmenere
Carignan
Red Lambrusco
Graciano
> 84 11.0%
5 Mourvedre
Rosé or
Mono Pinot Noir
Varietal of | Lempranillo
this Sangiovese
typology Montepulciano
Nero D’ Avola
Negroamaro
Merlot
84 11.5%
Primitivo
Syrah 91 11.0%

2,

(f) fis-subartikolu 7.3 taghha:

(1)  fil-paragrafu “Passito”, minflok il-kliem
“13.5% vol.” ghandhom jidhlu I-kliem “12.0% vol.” ; u

(1)  fil-paragrafu “Imqadded”, minflok il-kliem
“13.5% vol.” ghandhom jidhlu I-kliem “12.5% vol.” .

B 2171



B 2172

Jemenda l-iSkeda 3. Skeda II li tinsab mar-regolamenti principali ghandha tigi
II1i tinsab mar-

regolamenti principali. emendata kif gej:

(a) minflok il-kliem “4.1 Varieties allowed for the use
of a White / Red / Rose DO mention:” u t-tabella fis-sub-
artikolu 4.1 taghha, ghandu jidhol dan li ge;j:

“4.1 The DO “MALTA” Q.W.P.S R. wines shall be
produced from grapes harvested in the region described
in article 2 and only from the following grape varieties:

Typology Variety code Grape Variety *
11 Chardonnay
17 Girgentina
12 Chenin Blanc
24 Insolia

White 42 Pinot Bianco

48 Sauvignon Blanc
54 Trebbiano
55 Vermentino
56 Viognier
33 Moscato Bianco
34 Moscato di Alessandria
36 Moscato Giallo

Red / Rosé 7 Cabernet Sauvignon
6 Cabernet Franc
16 Gellewza
31 Merlot




49 Syrah

8 Carignan

9 Carmenere
22 Grenache

18 Graciano

25 Lambrusco
32 Montepulciano **
40 Nero d’Avola **
39 Negroamaro
37 Mourvedre
41 Petit Verdot
44 Pinot Noir
45 Primitivo
47 Sangiovese
51 Tempranillo

(b) fis-subartikolu 4.1.1 taghha, minflok il-kliem “the
names of 2 or 3 grape varieties” ghandhom jidhlu I-kliem
“the names of the 2 or 3 grape varieties being such varieties

having the highest percentage representation” ;

(¢) fis-subartikolu 4.2 taghha:

(1) minflok il-kliem “4.2 Varieties allowed for the
use of a Mono Varietal DO mention,” ghandu jidhol dan

li gej:

“4.2 The DO “GOZO” Q.W.P.S.R. wines
shall be produced from grapes harvested in

the region described in article 2 and only from the

following grape varieties:” ;

(ii) fit-tabella, minnufih wara r-ringiela
“Tempranillo” ghandhom jidhlu dawn ir-ringieli godda

li gejjin:

B 2173



B 2174

13

Sangiovese 47 Sangiovese
Carignan 8 Carignan
Primitivo 45 Primitivo

2

u minnufih wara r-ringiela “Moscato di Alessandria”
ghandhom jidhlu dawn ir-ringieli godda li gejjin:

13

Pinot Bianco 42 Pinot Bianco

Trebbiano 54 Trebbiano

” .

(d) fis-subartikolu 5.2 taghha minnufih wara I-kliem
“shall be of the Vertical Shoot Positioning (VSP) type”
ghandhom jidhlu I-kliem “or the traditional bush method
(alberello)” ;

(e) minflok it-tabella li tinsab fl-artikolu 6 taghha,
ghandu jidhol dan li gej:

For Mono
Varietal
Maximum | wines: Min.
Typology Variety Yield in Natural
hL/Ha Alcoholic
Strength

(% vol.)




Chardonnay
Sauvignon Blanc
. . &4 11.0%
Viognier
Insolia
White or
Pinot Bianco
Mono
Trebbiano
Varietal of
Chenin Blanc
this
| Vermentino o1 10,59,
typology %
Moscato Bianco
Moscato di
Alessandria
Moscato Giallo
Girgentina 91 10.0%
Rosé or Gellewza 91 10.0%
Mono
Varietal of
. Grenache
this 91 10.5%
typology Syrah
Red or
Mono
Grenache
Varietal of . 84 11.0%
Gellewza

this
typology

B 2175



B 2176

Red
or
Rosé or
Mono
Varietal of
this
typology

Cabernet
Sauvignon
Cabernet Franc
Carmenere
Carignan
Lambrusco
Graciano
Mourvedre
Pinot Noir
Tempranillo
Sangiovese
Montepulciano
Nero D’ Avola

Negroamaro

84

11.0%

Merlot

Primitivo

84

11.5%

Syrah

91

11.0%

(f) fis-subartikolu 7.3 taghha:

(1) fil-paragrafu “Passito”, ghall-kliem “13.5%
vol.” ghandhom jidhlu l-kliem “12.0% vol.” ; u

(i) fil-paragrafu “Imqadded”, ghall-kliem “13.5%
vol.” ghandhom jidhlu l-kliem “12.5% vol.” .



L.N. 168 of 2011

WINE ACT
(CAP. 436)

D.O.K. Wines Production Protocols (Amendment)
Regulations, 2011

IN exercise of the powers conferred by articles 12(1)
and 27 of the Wine Act, and in terms of regulations 10 and 11
of the Denomination of Origin and of Geographic Indications
Regulations, 2006, the Minister for Resources and Rural Affairs, on
the advice of the Wine Regulation Board, has made the following
regulations:-

1. The title of these regulations is the D.O.K. Wines
Production Protocols (Amendment) Regulations, 2011, and
they shall be read and construed as one with the D.O.K. Wines
Production Protocols Regulations 2007, hereinafter referred to as
“the principal regulations”.

2. Schedule I to the principal regulations shall be amended
as follows:

(a) for the words “4.1 Varieties allowed for the use of
White/Red/Rose DO mention:” and the table in sub-article
4.1 thereof, there shall be substituted the following:

“4.1 The DO “MALTA” Q.W.P.S.R. wines shall be
produced from grapes harvested in the region described
in article 2 and only from the following grape varieties:

B 2177

Citation.

L.N. 416 of 2007.

Amends Schedule
I to the principal
regulations.



B 2178

Typology Variety code Grape Variety *
11 Chardonnay
17 Girgentina
12 Chenin Blanc
24 Insolia
White 42 Pinot Bianco
48 Sauvignon Blanc
54 Trebbiano
55 Vermentino
56 Viognier
33 Moscato Bianco
34 Moscato di Alessandria
36 Moscato Giallo
Red / Rosé 7 Cabernet Sauvignon
6 Cabernet Franc
16 Gellewza
31 Merlot
49 Syrah
8 Carignan
9 Carmenere
22 Grenache
13 Graciano
25 Lambrusco
32 Montepulciano **
40 Nero d’Avola **
39 Negroamaro
37 Mourvedre




41 Petit Verdot
44 Pinot Noir
45 Primitivo
47 Sangiovese
51 Tempranillo

(b) in sub-article 4.1.1 thereof, for the words “the
names of 2 or 3 grape varieties” there shall be substituted
the words “the names of the 2 or 3 grape varieties being such
varieties having the highest percentage representation” ;

(c) in sub-article 4.2 thereof:

(1) for the words “4.2 Varieties allowed for the
use of a Mono Varietal DO mention” there shall be
substituted the following:

“The DO “MALTA” Q.W.P.S.R. wines shall
be produced from grapes harvested in the region
described in article 2 and only from the following
grape varieties:” ; and

(i1) in the table, immediately after the row
“Primitivo” there shall be inserted the following
new row:

Sangiovese 47 Sangiovese

(d) in sub-article 5.2 thereof, immediately after the
words “shall be of the Vertical Shoot Positioning (VSP) type”
there shall be added the words ““or the traditional bush method
(alberello)” ;

(e) for the table in article 6 thereof, there shall be
substituted the following:

B 2179



B 2180

For Mono
Varietal
wines:
Maximum
Minimum
Typology Variety Yield in
Natural
hL/Ha
Alcoholic
Strength
(% vol.)
Chardonnay
Sauvignon Blanc
84 11.0%
Viognier
Insolia
White or
Pinot Bianco
Mono
Trebbiano
Varietal of
Chenin Blanc
this
Vermentino
typology ) 91 10.5%
Moscato Bianco
Moscato di
Alessandria
Moscato Giallo
Girgentina 91 10.0%
Rosé or Gellewza 91 10.0%
Mono
Varietal of
. Grenache
this 91 10.5%
typology Syrah




Red or
Mono
Grenache
Varietal of . 84 11.0%
Gellewza
this
typology
Cabernet
Sauvignon
Cabernet Franc
Carmenere
Carignan
Red Lambrusco
Graciano
g 84 11.0%
A Mourvedre
Rosé or
Mono Pinot Noir
Varietal of Tempranillo
this Sangiovese
typology Montepulciano
Nero D’ Avola
Negroamaro
Merlot
T, 84 11.5%
Primitivo
Syrah 91 11.0%
”- and

(f) in sub-article 7.3 thereof

(i) in the paragraph “Passito”, for the words
“13.5% vol.” there shall be substituted the words “12.0%
vol.” ; and

(ii) in the paragraph “Imqadded”, for the words
“13.5% vol.” there shall be substituted the words “12.5%
vol.” .

B 2181



B 2182

ﬁme“hds Sc_he_d“'le 3. Schedule II to the principal regulations shall be amended
to the principa
regulations. as follows:

(a) for the words “4.1 Varieties allowed for the use of a
White / Red / Rose DO mention:” and the table in sub-article
4.1 thereof, there shall be substituted the following:

“4.1 The DO “MALTA” Q.W.P.S.R. wines shall be
produced from grapes harvested in the region described
in article 2 and only from the following grape varieties:

Typology Variety code Grape Variety *
11 Chardonnay
17 Girgentina
12 Chenin Blanc
24 Insolia

White 42 Pinot Bianco

48 Sauvignon Blanc
54 Trebbiano
55 Vermentino
56 Viognier
33 Moscato Bianco
34 Moscato di Alessandria
36 Moscato Giallo

Red / Rosé 7 Cabernet Sauvignon
6 Cabernet Franc
16 Gellewza
31 Merlot




49 Syrah

8 Carignan

9 Carmenere
22 Grenache

18 Graciano
25 Lambrusco
32 Montepulciano **
40 Nero d’Avola **
39 Negroamaro
37 Mourvedre
41 Petit Verdot
44 Pinot Noir
45 Primitivo
47 Sangiovese
51 Tempranillo

9,

(b) in sub-article 4.1.1 thereof, for the words “the
names of 2 or 3 grape varieties” there shall be substituted
the words “the names of the 2 or 3 grape varieties being such
varieties having the highest percentage representation” ;

(c) in sub-article 4.2 thereof:

(i) for the words “4.2 Varieties allowed for the
use of a Mono Varietal DO mention” , there shall be
substituted the following:

“The DO “GOZ0O” Q.W.P.S.R. wines shall
be produced from grapes harvested in the region
described in article 2 and only from the following
grape varieties:” ;

(ii) in the table, immediately after the row
“Tempranillo” there shall be inserted the following new

rows:

B 2183



B 2184

(13

Sangiovese 47 Sangiovese
Carignan 8 Carignan
Primitivo 45 Primitivo

’ .

(13

and immediately after the row “Moscato di Alessandria”
there shall be inserted the following new rows:

Pinot Bianco 42 Pinot Bianco

Trebbiano 54 Trebbiano

2 .

(d) 1in sub-article 5.2 thereof immediately after the
words “shall be of the Vertical Shoot Positioning (VSP) type”
there shall be added the words “or the traditional bush method
(alberello)” ;

(e) for the table in article 6 thereof, there shall be
substituted the following:

For Mono
Varietal

Maximum | wines: Min.

Typology Variety Yield in Natural
hL/Ha Alcoholic
Strength

(% vol.)




Chardonnay
Sauvignon Blanc
‘ ‘ 84 11.0%
Viognier
Insolia
White or
Pinot Bianco
Mono
Trebbiano
Varietal of
Chenin Blanc
this
Vermentino
typology ) 91 10.5%
Moscato Bianco
Moscato di
Alessandria
Moscato Giallo
Girgentina 91 10.0%
Ros¢ or Gellewza 91 10.0%
Mono
Varietal of
: Grenache
this 91 10.5%
typology Syrah
Red or
Mono
Grenache
Varietal of . 84 11.0%
Gellewza

this
typology

B 2185



B 2186

Cabernet
Sauvignon
Cabernet Franc
Carmenere
Carignan

Red Lambrusco

Graciano
or 84 11.0%

. Mourvedre
Rosé or

Mono Pinot Noir

Varietal of Tempranillo

this Sangiovese

Montepulciano

Nero D’ Avola

typology

Negroamaro

Merlot
84 11.5%

Primitivo

Syrah 91 11.0%

and
(f) in sub-article 7.3 thereof:

(1)  in the paragraph “Passito”, for the words
“13.5% vol.” there shall be substituted the words “12.0%
vol.” ; and

(i)  in the paragraph “Imqadded”, for the words
“13.5% vol.” there shall be substituted the words “12.5%
vol.”.

Ippubblikat mid-Dipartiment tal-Informazzjoni (doi.gov.nt) — Valletta — Published by the Department of Information (doi.gov.mt) — Valletta
Mitbugh fl-Istamperija tal-Gvern fuq karta riciklata — Printed at the Government Printing Press on recycled paper ‘l“
-

Prezz/Price
€0.90



